Town of LaGrange Special Meeting Minutes Tues, 21 March 2024 Ellsworth Road Bid Opening

A meeting was held on 21 March 2024 at 8am in the Town Hall to open and select the lowest apparent bids for the Ellsworth Road project.

All bidders attended, with the only absence from those on the 11 March bid walk being Integrity Grading and Excavating.

Sealed bids were opened and read aloud with the apparent winning bidders being Gerke for Contract 1 (excavating/dirt work) and Mathy for Contract 2 (paving.)

DATE: March, 21, 2024 TIME: 8:00 AM, Local Time PLACE: Townhall			EI Town of La	TABULATION OF BID Isworth Rd Reconditio Grange, Monroe Coun	ning									
	Gerke Excavating 15341 STH 131 Tomah, WI 54660 608 372 4203		Lepke Trucking Excavating E3014 County Rd. Chaseburg, WI 54621 608 483-2655		Mathy Construction 920 10th Ave North Onalaska, WI 54650 908 783 6411		Scott Construction E9827 CTH P Wisconsin Dells, WI 808 844-0424		Hegg Contractors W16502 Snake Coulee Road Blair, WI 54616 (608) 989-2211		Integrity Grading & Excavating 4001 Felland Rd #113 Madison, WI 53718 (715) 359-4042			
	X		x		X		x		X		X			
Bid Bond:			X		X		X		X		X			X
		Certified Check:							_					
CONTRACT 1: Ellsworth Rd Grading & Road Base Improvements for 1.4 miles			Unit		Unit		Unit		Unit		Unit		Unit	
No. Description	Qty.	Unit	Price	Amount	Price	Amount	Price	Amount	Price	Amount	Price	Amount	Price	Amount
1 Performance and Payment Bonds		Lump Sum		\$4,691.00		\$12,000.00						\$10,000.00		
2 Mobilization		Lump Sum Lump Sum		\$9,177.00 \$5,472.00		\$55,000.00						\$20,000.00 \$7,500.00		
3 Traffic Control 4 Sit Fence	4.200	LF	\$2.20	\$9,472.00	\$2.55	\$5,300.00 \$10,710.00					\$2.00	\$8,400.00		
5 Temporary Ditch Checks	35	Each	\$65.95	\$2,308.25	\$100.00	\$3,500.00					\$10.00	\$350.00		
6 Riprap & Outlets	12	Each	\$888.20	\$10,658.40	\$1,000.00	\$12,000.00					\$1,050.00	\$12,600.00		
7 Common Excavation		Lump Sum		\$87,842.00		\$91,980.00						\$150,000.00		
8 Pulverize Existing Road Base (8")	18072	SY	\$0.50	\$9,036.00	\$0.68	\$12,288.96					\$1.25	\$22,590.00		
9 6" Base Aggregate Dense 1-1/4"	10520	Tons	\$14.45	\$152,014.00	\$17.58	\$184,941.60					\$17.50	\$184,100.00		
10 6" Breaker Run 11 Geogrid	11732 25000	Tons SY	\$17.05 \$1.40	\$200,030.60 \$35.000.00	\$17.58 \$2.45	\$208,248.56 \$61,250.00					\$17.50 \$2.25	\$205,310.00 \$56,250.00		
12 15" RCP Pipe w/ end section	5	Each	\$4,944.60	\$24,723.00	\$8,000.00	\$30,000.00					\$5,400.00	\$27,000.00	-	
13 24" RCP Pipe w/ end section	5	Each	\$6,633.00	\$33,165.00	\$8,850.00	\$44,250.00					\$5,650.00	\$28,250.00		
14 2x3 Box Inlet with Grate	1	Each	\$2,944.00	\$2,944.00	\$2,250.00	\$2,250.00					\$4,500.00	\$4,500.00		
15 36" Curb & Gutter	2210	LF	\$22.50	\$49,725.00	\$23.00	\$50,830.00					\$21.40	\$47,294.00		
16 15" CMP Driveway Culverts	21	Each	\$1,590.15	\$33,393.15	\$1,618.57	\$33,989.97					\$2,340.00	\$49,140.00		
17 Reclaimed Topsoil Placement	3800	CY	\$4.65	\$17,670.00	\$3.95	\$15,010.00					\$9.00	\$34,200.00		
18 Hydro-mulch & Seed ROW	23333	SY	\$1.15	\$26,832.95	\$0.34	\$7,933.22			_		\$1.50	\$34,999.50		
19 Remaining miscellaneous items including, but not limited by enumeration: removal & reptacing of fencing, mail boxes, etc.		Lump Sum		\$27,176.55		\$5,000.00						\$12,500.00		
TOTAL CONTRACT 1:			\$741,098.90		\$844,482.31		NO BID		NO BID		\$914,983.50		N	BID
APPARENT LOW BIDDER:			1		l	2						3		
Indicate \$	1	CY	\$10.25		\$23.00						\$18.00			
of Barn #R shroop	Gerke Excavaling 15341 8TH 131 Tomah, WI 54660 606 372 4203		Lepke Trucking Excavating E3014 County Rd. Chaseburg, WI 54821 608-483-2655		Mathy Construction 620 10th Ave North Onalisaka, WI 54650 608 783 6411		Scott Construction E9827 CTH P Wis Delts 608 783 6411		Hegg Contractors W16502 Snake Coulee Road Blair, WI 54616 (608) 989-2211		Integrity Grading & Excavating 4001 Felland Rd #113 Madison, WI 53718 (715) 359-4042			
Addendum				X		X		X		X		Х		
Bid Bond:			X		X			X		X		Х		
Certified Check:														
CONTRACT 2: Ellsworth Rd Pavement Improvements for 1.4 miles with 2.5" HMA. No. Description	Qty.	Unit		Amount		Amount		Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
To furnish all materials, labor, tools, and equipment necessary to complete road firshin grading, powing, how defined the considering road markings & road signs, reative driveways, sci. na occordance with the plane & laboration of the control, finishing passing, powing, shouldering, road markings & road signs, restore driveways for the lump sum of		Lump Sum	NO BID		NO BID		\$465,844.95		\$585,794.00		NO BID		NO BID	
A metal all materials, later, took, and equipment secsions you complete read firsh guiding, pering, and the secondary on the plants & specifications, and not of considering read markings & read signs, etc. in secondario		Lump Sum	NO BID DEDUCT \$5,400 TO CO#1		NO BID		\$623,705.65		\$745,454.00		NO BID		NO BID	
			i			1		2						

Final bid award will occur at the 8 April Town Board meeting.